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Ar:chives
for old
recordings

By JOHN WOLCOTT
Globe-Democrat-CoPleY News
' SerVice

, SEATTLE.'- Nostalgic in-
{atuation with America's Past
has produced a growing de-

mand in recent Years for old.
movies, music from the rag-
time and big band eras and re-
plays of old radio comedies,
and dramas.
' But even before that nostal-
gia took hold, serious students
of history and educators have
been living in the Past with the
help of ihe University of
Washington's "Phonoar-
ehives" collection of news
broadcasts, speeches and oth-
er broadcast memorabilia.

"NINETY.FM Per cent oI
our listening material is news
and information rather than
entertainment so the nostalgia
craze hasn't affected us much
with the public.

"But for educators and re- |

searchers, ours is the only ex- |

tensive sound library in the 
I

nation that's usable,'' said cu- 
|

rator Donald Godfrey, on the
staff of the university's School 

1

of Communications, which
has responsibility for the ar-
chives.

So unique is the library that
requests for segtnents of its
"history in sound" collection
come from the Library of Con-
gress, CBS and the BBC.

Godfrey said the collr tion
is valuable for two reasons.
First, transcripts of early ra-
dio network news broadcasts
are rdre because stations nor-
mally carried the programs
live. Second, the university's
collection is the only one that
is uable because it is thor-
oughly indexed. The extensive
collection of early radio
broadcast recordings in the
Library of Congress, by con-
trast, is still in boxes and little
is known about their contents
or condition.

IT WAS ONLY by an unu:
sual combination of events
that the archives were assem-
bled, Godfrey explained.

To begin with, KIRO-CBS in
Seattle had made transcrip-
tions of more than 1,000 hours
of network broadcasts be-
tween Sept. 7, 1939, when the
German army marched into
Poland, to April 2, 1945, when
Allied forces crossed Ger-
many's borders. TheY were
recorded from New York CitY- 
broadeasts so they could be
replayed in Seattle at rnore
convenient V/est Coas'" times.

Fortunatelv, Saui Haas,
then president of Queen CitJ'
Broadcasting, owners ol
KIRO, had a sense of history

: and preserved the metal and
. glass reCording discs.

, In 1956, when UniversitY of
.., Washington Prof. Milo RYan

began searching for original
broadcasts from that World
War II era to fit into a televi-
sion program soundtrack, his
sleuthing uncovered the valu-
able discs in boxes stored in
KIRO's transmitter building
on Vashon Island.

KIRO management turned
the entire collection over to
the university and a $10,000
grant to the School of Com-
munications from CBS in 1957

financed B{esen,aris} -€trfif*
-"recofdings, including money

to record theilhistorical
sounds permanently on tape
because the fragile discs
themselves could only be,
played a few times.

There were 2,227 newscasts
on the discs, by such men as

Edward R. Murrow, H. V.
Kaltenborn, Elmer Davis,
Quentin Reynolds, William L.
Shirer and Eric Sevareid.

They reported on events
ranging from the JaPanese at-
tack on Pearl Harbor to the
bombing of Japan; landing of
Allied forces in North Africa;
the invaslon of EuroPe at Nor-
mandy; establishment of the
World SecuritY Council in
1945; V-E and V-J DaY events;
and the death and funeral of
President Franklin Roosevelt'

Among the sPeeches b1

world leaders are 5l bY FDR
including his famous "Fire'
side Chats," and 2l bY Win
ston Churchill. Entertainmenl
programs were few but in'

. cluded such classics as Frec
Allen's "Allen's AlleY" anc

"fibber McGee and MollY."

nYef'1. WHO retired fron
the universitY in 1970, wantec

the librarY to continue grow

ins. In latlr Years, KOMO ra'

di6 in Seattle added substan'

iiuff, to the collection and the

tuoing of contemPorarY
ii,iua."uttt added sPeeches

unO-,t tt*i."t during the l97i

oresidential campaign, the as'

iassination of President Ken'

il; ; 1963, and sPeeches bY

Pi.iio.ntt KennedY and Nix-

on.--l'Last 
vear we helPed ABC

in freii tearch for historical

"*a..Ptt 
from radio broad-

.urtt,'t*Oing one theY wanted

bv Winston Burdett tor a

sound track for a televtston

;;;i;,," Godfrev said. ."we
aiio piovi<teO 4otaPes of his-

L,?[Ni""ffi#ts io cai t" I

an education series being Pre- 
1

Dared on World War II.'' !

No discs or original recorO- |

tr*trilihtll[lilx#l


